

# Exhibit 1

DEFENDANTS' FEE OBJECTIONS - MASTER SPREADSHEET - WAGAFE V. TRUMP

Name	Position	Date	Description	Hours	Fee Sought	Total	Includes Clerical	Block Billing	Unreasonable/Vague	Inconsistent/Irreconcilable	Redundant/Duplicative	No objections	Reason
Hugh Handeyside	Attorney	3/21/2018	Confer regarding motion for sanctions	0.6	676.85	406.11						X	
Hugh Handeyside	Attorney	3/26/2018	Review and revise draft motion for sanctions	0.7	676.85	473.80					X		D. Perez, M. Adams, S. Tolchin, K. Macleod-Ball, and T. Realmut all reviewed
Hugh Handeyside	Attorney	3/26/2018	Review and revise draft motion for sanctions	0.8	676.85	541.48					X		D. Perez, M. Adams, S. Tolchin, K. Macleod-Ball, and T. Realmut all reviewed
Hugh Handeyside	Attorney	3/28/2018	Review and revise motion for sanctions; exchange correspondence on same	0.5	676.85	338.43		X			X		D. Perez, M. Adams, S. Tolchin, K. Macleod-Ball, and T. Realmut all reviewed
Hugh Handeyside	Attorney	4/10/2018	Review opposition to motion for sanctions; exchange correspondence on same	1.5	676.85	1,015.28		X			X		Unknown how much time was spent on each task; all other attorneys likewise billed for reviewing brief in opp.
Hugh Handeyside	Attorney	4/12/2018	Review and revise draft reply ISO motion for sanctions	1.8	676.85	1,218.33					X		S. Ahmed, K. Macleod-Ball, S. Tolchin, N. Gellert, D. Perez, and M. Adams all billed for the same entry
Matt Adams	Attorney	3/21/2018	editing sanctions motion	1.8	815.62	1,468.12					X		D. Perez, H. Handeyside, S. Tolchin, K. Macleod-Ball, and T. Realmut all reviewed
Matt Adams	Attorney	3/22/2018	finish editing sanctions motion	1	815.62	815.62					X		D. Perez, H. Handeyside, S. Tolchin, K. Macleod-Ball, and T. Realmut all reviewed
Matt Adams	Attorney	3/27/2018	pc re docs needed for sanctions motion	0.5	815.62	407.81						X	
Matt Adams	Attorney	3/30/2018	Call with ACLU, re next steps	1	815.62	815.62			X	X			ACLU co-counsel does not present any billing entries for this alleged call; this entry is also vague because it does not say what the call was about
Matt Adams	Attorney	4/10/2018	pc re response to ex parte mx and mc for sanctions	0.5	815.62	407.81		X					Response to ex parte mx not part of motion for sanctions; unknown how much time was spent on each task

Name	Position	Date	Description	Hours	Fee Sought	Total	Includes Clerical	Block Billing	Unreasonable/Vague	Inconsistent/Irreconcilable	Redundant/Duplicative	No objections	Reason
Matt Adams	Attorney	4/10/2018	Reviewing opp to mx for sanctions, and supporting declarations	1.8	815.62	1,468.12					X		All other attorneys billed for the same task
Matt Adams	Attorney	4/10/2018	Reading defs' opp to sanctions mx + mx for ex parte in camera review	0.7	815.62	570.93		X			X		All other attorneys billed for reviewing the opp. brief; motion for in camera review not part of motion for sanctions & it is unclear how much time atty spent on motion for unrelated work
Matt Adams	Attorney	4/12/2018	Reviewing & editing reply iso motion for sanctions	0.8	815.62	652.50					X		D. Perez, H. Handeyside, S. Tolchin, K. Macleod-Ball, and T. Realmut all reviewed
Nicolas Gellert	Attorney	3/21/2018	Consider strategy for sanctions motion	0.3	630	189.00						X	
Nicolas Gellert	Attorney	3/22/2018	Develop strategy for motion for sanctions and related issues	1.2	630	756.00		X			X		L. Hennessey developed strategy for motion for sanctions. "Related issues" is vague and may not be directly related to the Motion for Sanctions
Nicolas Gellert	Attorney	3/23/2018	Consider strategy for motion for sanctions, potential referral to magistrate, and discovery status generally	0.6	630	378.00		X					"Potential referral to magistrate" and "discovery status generally" are not part of the sanctions motion. It is unclear how much time was spent on each task.
Nicolas Gellert	Attorney	3/26/2018	Assist with strategy for motion for sanctions	0.3	630	189.00						X	
Nicolas Gellert	Attorney	3/27/2018	Develop strategy for motion for sanctions and assist with preparation of same and supporting declarations	2.2	630	1,386.00					X		L. Hennessey developed strategy for motion for sanctions
Nicolas Gellert	Attorney	3/28/2018	Assist with strategy for and prepaton of motion for sanctions and supporting materials	1.5	630	945.00				X	X		L. Hennessey developed strategy for motion for sanctions
Nicolas Gellert	Attorney	3/29/2018	Attend to final issues for motion for sanctions	0.2	630	126.00						X	
Nicolas Gellert	Attorney	4/9/2018	Review brief in opposition to motion for sanctions	0.4	630	252.00					X		All other attorneys billed for reviewing the opp. Brief

Name	Position	Date	Description	Hours	Fee Sought	Total	Includes Clerical	Block Billing	Unreasonable/Vague	Inconsistent/Irreconcilable	Redundant/Duplicative	No objections	Reason
Nicolas Gellert	Attorney	4/10/2018	Review response and supporting declarations on motion for sanctions and outline issues for reply	0.7	630	441.00					X		S. Ahmed, K. MacLeod-Ball, S. Tolchin, D. Perez, M. Adams, and H. Handeyside all billed for reviewing response
Nicolas Gellert	Attorney	4/11/2018	Review and suggest revisions to draft reply brief on motions for sanctions	0.5	630	315.00					X		S. Ahmed, K. MacLeod-Ball, S. Tolchin, D. Perez, M. Adams, and H. Handeyside all billed for reviewing response
Nicolas Gellert	Attorney	4/12/2018	Review revisions to reply brief on sanctions motion	0.2	630	126.00					X		S. Ahmed, K. MacLeod-Ball, S. Tolchin, D. Perez, M. Adams, and H. Handeyside all billed for reviewing response
David Perez	Attorney	3/7/2018	E-mail to team regarding sanctions motion	0.8	575	460.00						X	
David Perez	Attorney	3/8/2018	Emails with Perkins team regarding sanctions motion	0.5	575	287.50						X	
David Perez	Attorney	3/9/2019	Confer with L. Hennessey regarding sanctions motion	0.5	575	287.50						X	
David Perez	Attorney	3/15/2018	Revise outline for sanctions motion	0.7	575	402.50						X	
David Perez	Attorney	3/16/2018	Review motion for overlength brief in support of Sanctions Motion and e-mail C. Sepe regarding same	0.9	575	517.50						X	
David Perez	Attorney	3/19/2018	Revise motion for sanctions	4.3	575	2,472.50						X	
David Perez	Attorney	3/20/2018	Correspondence regarding sanctions motion (1); revise sanctions motion (.4)	2.4	575	1,380.00						X	
David Perez	Attorney	3/21/2018	Continue reviewing motion for sanctions	2.2	575	1,265.00						X	
David Perez	Attorney	3/21/2018	revise proposed order regarding sanctions motion	0.5	575	287.50						X	
David Perez	Attorney	3/21/2018	review court's order on page length and e-mails with N. Gellert and co-counsel regarding implications for sanctions motion	0.5	575	287.50						X	
David Perez	Attorney	3/21/2018	telephone conference with co-counsel to discuss case strategy	0.5	575	287.50						X	
David Perez	Attorney	3/22/2018	Telephone conference with Perkins team to discuss attorneys' fees petition (.5)	0.5	575	287.50						X	
David Perez	Attorney	3/22/2018	review L. Ruben's edits to sanctions motion (.4)	0.4	575	230.00					X		L. Hennessey reviewed all edits to the sanctions motion
David Perez	Attorney	3/26/2018	Review edits to motion for sanctions	0.6	575	345.00					X		L. Hennessey reviewed all edits to the sanctions motion

Name	Position	Date	Description	Hours	Fee Sought	Total	Includes Clerical	Block Billing	Unreasonable/Vague	Inconsistent/ Irreconcilable	Redundant/ Duplicative	No objections	Reason
David Perez	Attorney	3/28/2018	Revise sanctions motion (.9);	0.9	575	517.50					X		D. Perez already billed 4.3 hours on 3/19 , 1.4 hours on 3/20, and 2.2 hours on 3/21 for revising a 16-page document
David Perez	Attorney	3/28/2018	e-mails with co-counsel regarding requested relief for sanctions motion (.7);	0.7	575	402.50						X	
David Perez	Attorney	4/6/2018	Telephone conference with government to discuss their filings in camera in response to sanctions motion	0.5	575	287.50							X
David Perez	Attorney	4/10/2018	Review government's opposition to sanctions (1.0);	1	575	575.00					X		All other attorneys billed for reviewing government's opp. Brief
David Perez	Attorney	4/10/2018	telephone conference with co-counsel team regarding reply brief for sanctions (.5);	0.5	575	287.50						X	
David Perez	Attorney	4/11/2018	Review government's response to sanctions motion (.4);	0.4	575	230.00					X		All other attorneys billed for reviewing government's opp. Brief
David Perez	Attorney	4/11/2018	revise reply brief on sanctions motion (1.0);	1	575	575.00						X	
Laura Hennessey	Attorney	3/7/2018	Email regarding motion for sanctions	0.6	490	294.00						X	
Laura Hennessey	Attorney	3/8/2018	Confer with C. Sepe and W. hung regarding motion for sanctions (.5);	0.5	490	245.00						X	
Laura Hennessey	Attorney	3/8/2018	review and outline facts for motion for sanctions (2.5)	2.5	490	1,225.00						X	
Laura Hennessey	Attorney	3/9/2018	Confer with team and compile facts regarding motion for sanctions	1.8	490	882.00		X					The amount of time spent on each task is unknown
Laura Hennessey	Attorney	3/10/2018	Review discovery correspondence and pleadings and begin drafting fact section of Plaintiffs' omnibus motion for sanctions	4.7	490	2,303.00		X		X			The amount of time spent on each task is unknown
Laura Hennessey	Attorney	3/11/2018	Email regarding sanctions motion	0.1	490	49.00						X	
Laura Hennessey	Attorney	3/12/2018	Email regarding sanctions motion	0.2	490	98.00						X	
Laura Hennessey	Attorney	3/13/2018	Email regarding sanctions motion	0.2	490	98.00						X	
Laura Hennessey	Attorney	3/14/2018	Draft outline of motion for sanctions	2.7	490	1,323.00						X	
Laura Hennessey	Attorney	3/15/2018	Draft outline of motion for sanctions	1.9	490	931.00						X	
Laura Hennessey	Attorney	3/17/2018	Draft motion for sanctions	4.6	490	2,254.00						X	
Laura Hennessey	Attorney	3/18/2018	Draft omnibus motion for sanctions	9.3	490	4,557.00						X	

Name	Position	Date	Description	Hours	Fee Sought	Total	Includes Clerical	Block Billing	Unreasonable/Vague	Inconsistent/Irreconcilable	Redundant/Duplicative	No objections	Reason
Laura Hennessey	Attorney	3/19/2018	Email regarding details for motion for sanctions (1.6);	1.6	490	784.00			X				1.6 hours on an email is unreasonable/Billing Judgment Rule
Laura Hennessey	Attorney	3/19/2018	finalize and file motion for overlength brief (1.0);	1	490	490.00	X	X	X				Filing a motion is noncompensable clerical work & it is unclear how much time was spent on each task
Laura Hennessey	Attorney	3/19/2018	incorporate D. Perez edits into clean copy of motion for sanctions (1.5);	1.5	490	735.00						X	
Laura Hennessey	Attorney	3/19/2018	email regarding attorney's fees calculations (.5);	0.5	490	245.00						X	
Laura Hennessey	Attorney	3/20/2018	Edit motion for sanctions and accompanying declaration and proposed order (2.00);	2	490	980.00		X					It is unclear how much time was spent on each task & whether the time spent on each task would be reasonable
Laura Hennessey	Attorney	3/20/2018	confer with T. Marino regarding motion for sanctions (0.50);	0.5	490	245.00						X	
Laura Hennessey	Attorney	3/20/2018	review and edit time entries for monetary sanctions support (1.00);	1	490	490.00	X						This is noncompensable clerical work
Laura Hennessey	Attorney	3/21/2018	Bi-monthly co-counsel call to discuss motion for sanctions (1.00);	1	490	490.00				X			Other attorneys report that this call lasted between 0.5 and 0.6 hours; L. Hennessey reports that the call lasted 1.0 hours
Laura Hennessey	Attorney	3/21/2018	email regarding motion for sanctions and related documentation (1.50)	1.5	490	735.00			X				It is unreasonable to bill 1.5 hours for an email/Billing Judgment Rule
Laura Hennessey	Attorney	3/22/2018	Confer with Perkins team regarding sanctions motion (0.50);	0.5	490	245.00						X	
Laura Hennessey	Attorney	3/22/2018	email and telephone conferences regarding motion for sanctions and edits to accompanying documents (2.50);	2.5	490	1,225.00		X		X			It is unclear how much time was spent on each task & whether the time spent on each task would be reasonable; the only other attorney to report a phone call this date (Perez) reports that the call only lasted 0.5 hours

Name	Position	Date	Description	Hours	Fee Sought	Total	Includes Clerical	Block Billing	Unreasonable/Vague	Inconsistent/Irreconcilable	Redundant/Duplicative	No objections	Reason
Laura Hennessey	Attorney	3/26/2018	Edit motion for sanctions and accompanying documentation	3.3	490	1,617.00		X	X				L. Hennessey has already billed 3.5 hours for "editing" the 16-page motion and over 17 hours drafting the motion
Laura Hennessey	Attorney	3/27/2018	Team call to discuss motion for sanctions (.6);	0.6	490	294.00						X	
Laura Hennessey	Attorney	3/27/2018	edit motion for sanctions and accompanying documents (3.1);	3.1	490	1,519.00		X	X				L. Hennessey has already billed 7.1 hours for "editing" the 16-page motion and over 17 hours drafting the motion
Laura Hennessey	Attorney	3/27/2018	email regarding attorneys fee declarations in support of motion for sanctions (.5);	0.5	490	245.00						X	
Laura Hennessey	Attorney	3/27/2018	email regarding finalization of motion for sanctions (1.0);	1	490	490.00			X				It is unreasonable to bill 1.0 hours for drafting an email/Billing Judgment Rule
Laura Hennessey	Attorney	3/28/2018	Finalize motion for sanctions and accompanying documents for filing;	3.9	490	1,911.00		X	X		X		(1) It is unclear what "finalizing" means. (2) L. Hennessey has already billed 10.2 hours for "editing" the 16-page motion and over 17 hours drafting the motion. (3) It is unclear how much time was spent on each task
Laura Hennessey	Attorney	3/29/2018	Finalize papers and oversee filing of motion for sanctions;	4	490	1,960.00	X	X	X		X		(1) It is unclear what "finalizing" means. (2) L. Hennessey has already billed 3.9 hours for "finalizing" the motion. (3) It is unclear how much time was spent on each task. (4) "Filing" the motion for sanctions is uncompensable clerical work
Laura Hennessey	Attorney	4/4/2018	Team call with co-counsel to discuss motion for sanctions reply and other issues	0.6	490	294.00				X			No one else reports a phone call for this date
Laura Hennessey	Attorney	4/5/2018	Confer with C. Sepe and W. Hung regarding sanctions reply brief (.6);	0.6	490	294.00						X	

Name	Position	Date	Description	Hours	Fee Sought	Total	Includes Clerical	Block Billing	Unreasonable/Vague	Inconsistent/Irreconcilable	Redundant/Duplicative	No objections	Reason
Laura Hennessey	Attorney	4/5/2018	confer with D. Perez regarding sanctions reply brief (.3);	0.3	490	147.00				X			D. Perez does not report any time on this date
Laura Hennessey	Attorney	4/5/2018	confer with S. Wyatt regarding sanctions reply brief (.3);	0.3	490	147.00						X	
Laura Hennessey	Attorney	4/6/2018	Email regarding motion for sanctions reply brief and related meet and confers	0.8	490	392.00						X	
Laura Hennessey	Attorney	4/10/2018	Review opposition brief and accompanying materials and draft reply brief in support of motion for sanctions (7.2);	7.2	490	3,528.00		X					It is unclear how much time was spent on each task and whether the time spent is reasonable
Laura Hennessey	Attorney	4/10/2018	confer with cocounsel regarding reply brief in support of motion for sanctions (.5);	0.5	490	245.00						X	
Laura Hennessey	Attorney	4/11/2018	Draft reply brief ISO motion for sanctions	3.2	490	1,568.00						X	
Sameer Ahmed	Attorney	3/1/2018	Meet and confer call regarding <b>class list</b> and sanctions motion	1	600.38	600.38		X		X			(1) Class list is not part of motion for sanctions & it is unclear how much time was spent on each task; (2) no other attorney reports a phone call this date
Sameer Ahmed	Attorney	3/5/2018	Meet and confer call regarding sanctions motion	0.5	600.38	300.19				X			No other attorney reports a phone call on this date
Sameer Ahmed	Attorney	3/7/2018	Meet and confer call with defendants	1	600.38	600.38						X	
Sameer Ahmed	Attorney	3/16/2018	Revise motion for overlength brief for sanctions motion	0.5	600.38	300.19					X		D. Perez & S. Tolchin also billed for revising the motion for overlength brief
Sameer Ahmed	Attorney	3/25/2018	Revise motion for sanctions	1.2	600.38	720.46					X		D. Perez, M. Adams, H. Handeyside, S. Tolchin, K. Macleod-Ball, and T. Realmut all reviewed
Sameer Ahmed	Attorney	3/27/2018	Call to discuss motion for sanctions	1	600.38	600.38				X			Hennessey and Tolchin both report that the call lasted 0.6 hours, but Sameer Ahmed reported that the call lasted 1 hour.
Sameer Ahmed	Attorney	4/6/2018	Call to discuss motion for sanctions	0.5	600.38	300.19				X			No other attorney reports a phone call on this date



Name	Position	Date	Description	Hours	Fee Sought	Total	Includes Clerical	Block Billing	Unreasonable/Vague	Inconsistent/Irreconcilable	Redundant/Duplicative	No objections	Reason
Sameer Ahmed	Attorney	4/10/2018	Call to discuss motion for sanctions reply brief	0.5	600.38	300.19						X	
Sameer Ahmed	Attorney	4/12/2018	Telephonic hearing re ex parte in camera docs and prep for hearing	1	600.38	600.38		X		X			Ex parte in camera hearing is not part of the motion for sanctions
Sameer Ahmed	Attorney	4/12/2018	Revise reply brief in support of motion for sanctions	1	600.38	600.38					X		N. Gellert, K. MacLeod-Ball, S. Tolchin, D. Perez, M. Adams, and H. Handeyside all billed for reviewing response
Stacy Tolchin	Attorney	3/7/2018	Call with team RE <b>discovery</b> and sanctions motions	0.7	676.85	473.80		X		X			(1) Discovery is not part of the motion for sanctions; (2) Unclear how much time was spent on sanctions motion; (3) no other attorneys on team mention this phone call
Stacy Tolchin	Attorney	3/16/2018	Review of motion for oversized draft	0.2	676.85	135.37					X		D. Perez & S. Ahmed also billed for revising the motion for overlength brief
Stacy Tolchin	Attorney	3/20/2018	Sanctions declaration	0.7	676.85	473.80						X	
Stacy Tolchin	Attorney	3/21/2018	Call re motion for sanctions	0.6	676.85	406.11						X	
Stacy Tolchin	Attorney	3/21/2018	Review of motion for sanctions	1.1	676.85	744.54					X		D. Perez, M. Adams, H. Handeyside, S. Ahmed K. Macleod-Ball, and T. Realmuto all billed for review of motion for sanctions
Stacy Tolchin	Attorney	3/27/2018	Call re motion for sanctions	0.6	676.85	406.11						X	
Stacy Tolchin	Attorney	3/27/2018	declaration and fees for motion	0.5	676.85	338.43	X	X	X				(1) This entry is vague; (2) it is unclear how much time was spent on "declaration" and how much time was spent on "fees." (3) Fees/compiling time entries is uncompensable clerical work
Stacy Tolchin	Attorney	4/10/2018	Call re reply on motions for sanctions	0.5	676.85	338.43						X	
Stacy Tolchin	Attorney	4/10/2018	Review of opp	0.2	676.85	135.37					X		All other attorneys bill for reviewing the brief in opp.

Name	Position	Date	Description	Hours	Fee Sought	Total	Includes Clerical	Block Billing	Unreasonable/Vague	Inconsistent/Irreconcilable	Redundant/Duplicative	No objections	Reason
Stacy Tolchin	Attorney	4/12/2018	Review of reply	0.4	676.85	270.74					X		N. Gellert, K. MacLeod-Ball, S. Ahmed D. Perez, M. Adams, and H. Handeyside all billed for reviewing reply
Trina Realmuto	Attorney	3/23/2018	Review mx for sanctions	0.8	815.62	652.50					X		D. Perez, M. Adams, H. Handeyside, S. Ahmend, S. Tolchin, and K. MacLeod-Ball all billed for review of motion for sanctions
Trina Realmuto	Attorney	3/27/2018	Review dec and records for motion for sanctions	0.1	815.62	81.56						X	
Kristin Macleod-Ball	Attorney	3/26/2018	Review mx for sanctions	0.9	415.36	373.82					X		D. Perez, M. Adams, H. Handeyside, S. Ahmend, S. Tolchin, and T. Realmuto all billed for review of motion for sanctions
Kristin Macleod-Ball	Attorney	3/27/2018	work on declaration and records for mx for sanctions	1	415.36	415.36	X	X					(1) Preparing time records is uncompensable clerical work; (2) it is unclear how much time was spent on each task
Kristin Macleod-Ball	Attorney	4/13/2018	review reply ISO mx for sanctions	0.2	415.36	83.07					X		N. Gellert, S. Tolchin, S. Ahmed D. Perez, M. Adams, and H. Handeyside all billed for reviewing reply

<b>Plaintiffs' Total Fees Request</b>	<b>\$ 73,476.08</b>
<b>Reduction of 50% of each block-billed entry</b>	<b>\$ (7,946.39)</b>

M. Adams: 4/10/18;  
N. Gellert: 3/23/18;  
L. Hennessey:  
 3/9/18, 3/10/18,  
 3/19/18, 3/20/18,  
 3/22/18, 3/28/18,  
 3/29/18, 4/10/18; S.  
Ahmed: 3/1/18; S.  
Tolchin: 3/7/18,  
 3/27/18; K.  
MacLeod-Ball:  
 3/27/18

Name	Position	Date	Description	Hours	Fee Sought	Total	Includes Clerical	Block Billing	Unreasonable/Vague	Inconsistent/ Irreconcilable	Redundant/ Duplicative	No objections	Reason
<b>Reduction for duplicative billing</b>						<b>\$ (18,180.05)</b>							
<u>H. Handeyside:</u> 3/26/18 (2 entries), 3/28/18, 4/10/18, 4/12/18; <u>M. Adams:</u> 3/21/18, 3/22/18, 4/10/18 (2 entries), 4/12/18; <u>N. Gellert:</u> 3/22/18, 3/27/18, 3/28/18, 4/9/18, 4/10/18, 4/11/18, 4/12/18; <u>D. Perez:</u> 3/22/18, 3/26/18, 4/10/18, 4/11/18; <u>S. Ahmed:</u> 3/16/18, 3/25/18, 4/12/18; <u>S. Tolchin:</u> 3/16/18, 3/21/18, 4/10/18, 4/12/18; <u>T. Realmuto:</u> 3/23/18; <u>K. MacLeod-Ball:</u> 3/26/18, 4/13/18													
<b>Reduction of 50% for each entry of unreasonable billing</b>						<b>\$ (2,572.50)</b>							
<u>L. Hennessey:</u> 3/19/18, 3/21/18, 3/26/18, 3/27/18													
<b>Reduction for Irreconcilable/Inconsistent billing</b>						<b>\$ (2,126.91)</b>							
<u>L. Hennessey:</u> 3/21/18 (reduce time to 0.5), 4/4/18, 4/5/18; <u>S. Ahmed:</u> 3/5/18, 3/27/18 (reduce time to 0.6), 4/6/18, 4/12/18													
<b>Reduction for Vague Entries</b>						<b>\$ (815.62)</b>							
<u>M. Adams:</u> 3/30/18													
<b>Reduction for Clerical Work</b>						<b>\$ (490.00)</b>							
<u>L. Hennessey:</u> 3/20/18													
<b>Total Deductions due to Objections</b>						<b>\$ (32,131.47)</b>							
<b>Total due to Plaintiffs after Deductions due to Objections</b>						<b>\$ 41,344.61</b>							
<b>75% Deduction for only partially succeeding on Motion for Sanctions</b>						<b>\$ 31,008.46</b>							
<i>Alternative 50% Deduction for only partially succeeding on Motion</i>						<i>\$ 20,672.31</i>							
<b>TOTAL DUE TO PLAINTIFFS FOR MOTION FOR SANCTIONS</b>						<b>\$ 10,336.15</b>							
<i>Alternative Total to Plaintiffs with a 50% overall deduction</i>						<i>\$ 20,672.31</i>							

*\*Where there are multiple objections to one time entry, the objection marked with the larger, bolded X is the objection for which Defendants deducted fees. That said, should the Court disagree with the objection on which a particular deduction is based, Defendants believe that any of the other marked objections provide equal support for that deduction. No individual time entry has been deducted twice even if it has more than one objection marked.*